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To preserve and strengthen 
Denali, the literary magazine 
on campus, the LCC Media 
Commision adopted new 
guidelines that go into effect 
next Fall Term. 

The unanimous decision to 
accept the new guidelines came 
at the April 20 meeting after 
an ad hoc committee establish-
ed by the commission com-
pleted a 12-week study of the 
magazine. The study included 
interviews with past editors, 
staff members and faculty ad-
visers. 

The study was prompted 
Fall Term when Denali Editor 
Patricia MacDonald resigned 
her position because of finan-
cial difficulties. Noting that 

editor and staff resignations 
were common over the years, 
remaining staff members ask-
ed the commission for a 
''restructuring" of the 
publication's guidelines so it 
might survive in the future. 

''The committee took the 
time to interview past staff 
members and advisers,'' said a 
pleased Pete Peterson, 
TORCH faculty adviser and a 
committee member along with 
Denali advisers Peggy 
Marston and Chuck Ruff, 
Language Arts Department 
Chairman Jack Powell, and 
Torch editor Chris Gann and 
Denali Editor Debbie Brown. 
''Then it proposed a new for-
mat, an altered advising 
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New format for Denali 
system, a more efficient 
distribution system, and a new 
emphasis that will most likely 
eliminate the difficult pro-
blems.'' 

Peterson said a great deal of 
credit goes to Vice President 
for Student Activities Jack 
Carter who dedicated some 
funding (about $1,500 per 
year) to pay for a new 
technical adviser to the student 
staff. 

The new features of the 
guidelines include the follow-
ing: 
• Denali will now have a new 

emphasis -- on creative and 
imaginative writing 
and a reduced emphasis on the 
graphic and fine arts. 
• Denali will be published 

five times a year -- instead of 
the current twice a year. 
• The editor and associate 

editor will be paid small 
stipends -- provided the pro-
duction costs remain within 
budget projections. 
• Denali will be printed on 

newsprint, and be distributed 
as an insert to the TORCH. 
• Language Arts Depart-

ment advisers will continue to 
be volunteers, but will only be 

required to assist with 
manuscript evaluation and 
editing. 
• A new technical adviser 

will work about 6 hours per 
week with students to produce 
the five magazines -- to assist 
with typesetting, design, paste-
up, process camera work, and 
other technical requirements. 

TORCH editor Chris Gann 
said "Denali will have a much 
more rigid structure, but the 
student editor remains in com-
plete editorial control over 
content and selection policy.'' 

Denali Adviser Peggy 
Marston says the new 
guidelines will give the 
magazine's editor and staff 
"structure, expectations, and 
technical assistance they didn't 
have before.'' She says the 
staff will know how many 
times the magazine is to be 
published, and what the 
magazine's basic operating 
budget is. 

"All of those are positive 
things that will help Denali 
look at the job seriously and 
still allow the staff to be 
creative while operating within 
a budget." 

1984-85 Editors Sought 

Students interested in 
managing either of the two 
LCC student publications next 
year may obtain application 
materials beginning this Fri-
day, April 27. Deadline is 
Monday, May 7. 

Application forms will in-
clude full sets of the Media 
Commission Guidelines, ac-
companying statements on 
student publications policies, 
and explanations of the inter- , 
viewing and selection pro-
cedures. 
• The Commission 

Guidelines state that the 
TORCH editor must have · 
prior journalism training and · 
experience "in such capacities 
as will give her /him an ade-
quate understanding of the 
operations of a newspaper.'' 

TORCH applications will be 
avail~ble beginning Friday, 
April 27 from Faculty Adviser 
Pete Peterson, Center 205C. 
• Applications for Denali 

editor will be available from 
Advisers Peggy Marston or 
Chuck Ruff in Center 479 or 
Center 44 7, respectively. 

Faby identifies critical global environmental issues 
by Ellen Platt 
TORCH Associate Editor 

To illustrate the difficulties 
of cleaning the international 
environment, Jean Claude 
Faby related the problems the 
United Nations faced in its ef-
forts to protect and clean the 
Mediterranean Sea. 

Faby, deputy director of the 
United Nations Environmen- • 
tal Program (UNEP),speaking 
at LCC last Wednesday, said 
the organization chose the 
Mediterranean for several 
reasons: It was small enough 
to be a manageable problem; 
and scientists had predicted it 
would be dead, "a vast sewer 
with few life forms'' by the 
year 2,000. 

And, he said, the Mediterra-
nean presented an opportunity 
to see if the nations surroun-
ding it -- which were at odds 
politically, and were widely 
varied in degree of economic 
development -- could work 
together. 

The UNEP plan dealt with 
the legal, political, and 
economic aspects of the clean-
up. Proposed legal treaties ad-
dressed the problems of the 
dumping of waste at sea, land-
based pollution, the destruc-
tion of endangered species and 
their habitat, and oil spills. 

Faby estimated 80 percent 
of the pollution was from 
sewage, industrial discharge, 
and agricultural run-off. 
Upgrading sewage treatment 
and industrial pollution con-
trols alone cost $10 billion. 

The success of the project 
can be traced to several things: 
UNEP was a politically 
neutral organization; it was an 
all-or-nothing effort, "one 
country's efforts could be 
negated by their neighbors;'' 
and the affection of the na-
tions and their people for the 
sea was ''very helpful to us to 
gain popular and political sup-
port needed" to implement the 
program, Faby reported. 

Faby assessed the dif-
ficulties UNEP faces in pro-
tecting the environment and 
getting nations to participate 
in international programs. 
''While there is more law 
tampering with what govern-
ments can do, the concept of 
national sovereignty hasn't 
changed much since the 16th, 
17th, and 18th centuries." 

Faby told his audience of 
120 that the United Nations 
Environmental Program, 
(UNEP) formed 12 years ago, 
first addressed global en-
vironmental issues at the 
Stockholm Conference on 
Human Environment in 1972. 

The Stockholm conference 
reflected the growing world-
wide concern about en-
vironmental pollution. 
Popular grassroots organiza-
tions "literally forced the 
hands of their governments to 
deal with the problems," Faby 
said. 

One of the most striking dif-
ferences at Stockholm was the 
gap between the views of the 
developed and undeveloped 
nations which attended the 
conference. 

Faby said the rich arrived 
with a concern about the 
pollution and the problem "of 
cleaning the environment dir-
tied by industry." But the 
poorer and underdeveloped 
nations "felt the West was 
pulling a fast one on them'' by 
demanding costly environmen-
tal measures as part of 
development. 

Ten years after this con-
ference -- which created '' a 
basic bill of action" composed 
of 115 resolutions on en-
vironmental issues -- another 
conference was held in 
Nairobi. This session conclud-
ed that the basic message of 
Stockholm remained valid: To 
"safeguard the environment 
for future generations.'' The 
signs of progress are 
favorable, "environment is 

part of the global vocabulary 
and consciousness'' Faby 
reported. 

In addition, the number of 
governments with some sort of 
mechanism to deal with en-
vironmental issues has risen 
from a dozen in 1972 to 150 in 
1982, although the "degrees of 
effectiveness" vary. 

gress about by 2000, or face 
serious problems." These are 
soil loss, tropical deforesta-
tion, and loss of genetic diver-
sity in plant and animal 
species. 

The loss of arable land af-
fects all nations, although the 
underdeveloped countries are 
more severely affected because 
they lack the technology to 
compensate for the loss. 

Citing predicted global 
population figures of 10-12 
billion by the year 2100, 
"coupled with a 30 percent 
loss of arable land, how will 
we feed the world popula-
tion?" Faby wondered. 

Another factor in the loss of 
arable land is the "creeping 
desert.'' In the last 20 years 

» the ''phenomenon of deser-
~ tification'' has been recogniz-
~ ed and credited to climatic 

Jean Claude Faby 
On the other hand, Faby 

said there is little visible pro-
gress or success in dealing with 
a host of issues ranging from 
water pollution, to depletion 
of forests, to mismanagement 
of human affairs. 

Three Global Issues 
Faby identified three global 

environmental issues which 
''we will have to make pro-

~ change and human 
mismanagement of the land. 

Faby estimated it would 
take an annual investment of 
$3.5 billion to "stop the march 
of the desert and . reclaim 
land." The cost of preven-
tative action is ''globally not 
that much money, but finding 
these resources in today's 
economic and political cir-
cumstances'' is difficult, noted 
Faby. 
F ABY-----condnued on paae 5 
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Electoral apathy -- break a bad habit 
by Ellen Platt 
TORCH Associate Editor 

The results of the ASLCC 
elections are in -- and once 
again it's apathy by a land-
slide. 

Yes indeed, the 648 of us 
who did vote ( eight percent of 
the student body) had a say -- • 
admittedly indirectly -- in how 
$71,000 of YOUR money 
will be spent. 

I realize it's hard to get ex-
cited about student govern-
ment, school is only part of 
your life, and you're probably 
only going to be here for a 
year or two. 

But electoral apathy is a bad 
habit, and in these days of 
global political and economic 
crisis it can be downright 

Letters 
Earth Fair 
garners 
kudos 
To the Editor: 

The ASLCC would like to 
express their deep gratitude to 
Michael Blackburn, and Den-
nis Banner and other folks in 
the Energy Resource Groups 
for their dedicated efforts in 
coordinating this year's 
"Earth Fair." 

The importance of recogniz-
ing the relevance of the earth's 
relationship into our daily 
lives cannot be emphasized 
. enough. We must 
·acknowledge the grave 
dangers that we face today, yet 
at the same time, maintain a 
strong sense of optimism by 

, accepting the challange to con-
cern ourselves in order to 
secure our future . 

This year's "Earth Fair" is 
a beautiful example of various 
LCC departments, student 
groups and community 
organizations working 
together in cooperative 
fashion to produce such fine 
quality cultural events. It is 
hoped that this precedent can 
serve as an inspiration for all 
of us at LCC when ''Earth 
Fair 1985" comes around. 
Students, faculty and staff 
who want to get involved in 

unhealthy. 
During Earth Week many 

speakers emphasized the im-
portance of citizen involve-
ment. No matter who you 
think "they" are in the 
political spectrum, it's much 
easier for "them" to run 
things if you don't vote or 
voice your opinions. 

If you feel that you can't af-
fect political events, just 
remember that small, highly 
organized groups can thwart 
huge organizations by filing 
small law suits. 

Getting involved isn't just 
voting. Write your elected 
representatives -- a single letter 
received in Washington is 
calculated to represent the sen-
timents of 1,000 constituents. 

Join organizations which 

next year's events please con-
tact the ASLCC. 

Bryan Moore 
ASLCC President 

PNB 
hangs up 
To the Editor: 

I can't help wondering if the 
people at the Pacific Nor-
thwest Bell really have their 
consumers' interest in mind 
when they make decisions like 
implementing a business 
measure service for two-thirds 
of Oregon. Is it any wonder 
that public pressure has 
brought them to put a lid on 
the maximum amount they 
can charge of $79.80 per line 
per month for the first year. I 
wonder if they would have 
gotten the same approval from 
our wonderful public utility 
commissioner, if they had 
waltzed up and asked for a 
raise in the flat rates they 
could charge businesses per 
line at the same $79.80. What 
would the public have said 
then? 

Well, PNB, the unavoidable 
truth has struck home. Your 
little smokescreen will force 
big companies, state and 
government offices, and 
anyone else who can afford 
the luxuries of owning their 
own private telephone system 
to switch! This will create a 
revenue vacuum and everyone 

41,.1)" ~~L ~) ~t,/NN1~ ..... ,4,,, /)' "1 , ..,. ,y A. ~)'),,. ~,, • 4-' /~ t'. 1/.=-- ... , . ,t.- ,!(- ~ 
· y .._. I, :;:-_ .:::_"-

~ ["\ '(; tJ J) r&~~~ -,JI '~ =~~ 
1\~' 

11ackb;,-J 
7)//LC ' Sf 

reflect your opinions, they can 
afford to hire lobbyists to keep 
tabs on the issues before 
governmental bodies. 

Remember, the squeaky 
wheel gets the oil, if you've 
squeaked at least you're par-
ticipating .. 

Although you've all heard it 
before, I'll say it again --
voting is a privilege. Exercise 
your right regularly to keep 
our system in shape. 

Government at all levels 
spends an enormous amount 
of your hard-earned money. 
We've all invested in this na-
tion, as stockholders it is our 
right to expect a fair return on 
this investment. 

Sometimes it seems that 
many of the people who • 
scream the loudest vote the 

who is left will be forced to 
pay spiraling costs to make up 
for the people forced out of 
your phone system. Is this 
your idea of conservation? 
Rising (sic) the c9sts until peo-
ple can no long~r afford to use 
the phone? Whatever happen-
ed to a universal phone ser-
vice? Kinda has a certain ring 
to it! However, I'm old-
fashioned in a way, I believe in 
competition. People getting 
what they pay for or they go 
somewhere else! 

Now that you've got a two-
fold increase in flat rates, I'm 
sorry measured business ser-
vice, what can we expect in 
return? Better service? More 
frills? A completely updated 
modern telephone company? 
Hello! Hello! Hello! Click, 
click, click. Operator, I can't 
understand it, I was just talk-
ing to them a minute ago. I 
think somewhere we became 
disconnected. Credit, oh boy! 
What will I do without the 
phone company? 

Richard Gold 

Reagan 
bans 
chemicals 
To the Editor: 

I would like to take this op-
portunity to praise President 
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least. Here at LCC the age 
range of the student body is 
quite wide, from 18 to 60. 

Nationwide, young people, 
particularly those 18 to 20, 
have the worst voting record. 
The US Census Bureau figures 
that only 50 percent of the 
population between 18 and 25 
is registered to vote. What is 
even more pitiful is that only 
40 percent of those registered 
actually vote. 

Compare this to the people 
aged 45 to 65. Three-quarters 
of them are registered, and 
nearly 70 percent of them 
vote. 

It's sad that we can find so 
many excuses for not voting. 
The political decisions made 
today could affect us for the 
next 40 years. 

Reagan's proposal for a 
worldwide ban on the produc-
tion and use of chemical 
weapons. As we have seen 
with the war between Iran and 
Iraq the world has learned lit-
tle from the lessons of WWI. 

This is an especially hideous 
form of warfare. Unfortunate-
ly, neither the Iraqi or Soviet 
military seems willing to shy 
away from using these 
weapons. Of course, the 
Soviets, unlike the Iraqis, have 
even been guilty of using these 
weapons against civilian 
populations located in 
Afghanistan. 

Photo credit was regretfully 
omitted from this photo of 
Linus Pauling in last week's 
paper. The photo was taken by 
Ann Van Camp whose plea-
sant acceptance of our mistake 
is gratefully acknowledged. 

Act today -- if you're not 
registered to vote, do it! Voter 
registration forms are 
available at the Student 
Resource Center, second floor 
of the Center Building, in 
front of the library, and at the 
county building downtown. 
For more information, call the 
county elections people at 
687-4234. 

Vote on May 15, you can 
register up to and on the day 
of the primary. And remember 
what Congressman Weaver 
said when he spoke on campus 
last week: "The only thing you 
can do is to work like hell to 
elect people -- presidents, con-
gressmen, legislators 
remember you've got more 
votes than they do, that's the 
only thing we've got more of 
than they do.'' 

It would be beneficial to the 
~ntire human race if the 
leaders of the world ( especially 
the new Soviet regime) would 
sit down and work out a com-
prehensive and verifiable 
agreement to ban such 
weapons. 

Douglas F. Green 
Springfield, Oregon 
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Earth Fair '84 
New waste recovery program for Lane County 

Commissioner Rust speaks of high hopes for county 
waste proposals. 

by Jackie Barry 
TORCH Associate Editor 

Is there anything interesting 
to be said about garbage? In 
Lane County there is and 
Commissioner Jerry Rust said 
it at noon on April 16 as part 
of the Earth Week presenta-
tions. 

Suggesting that we go to a 
''compost standard instead of 
a gold standard,'' Rust in-
formed listeners of the state of 
waste recovery past, present, 
and future in Lane County. 

In 1983, Rust was finally 
able to find the support of two 
other commissioners on the 
county board which enabled 
implementation of an 
"ambitious" waste recovery 
plan for Lane County. The 
plan is to recover 10 percent of 
the county's waste for each of 
the next five years, reducing 
the total amount of waste by 

50 percent. The Glenwood 
dump site will be redesigned to 
recover waste and when Lane 
County writes a new fee-takers 
contract in the next year it may 
include requirements for 
recovery activites to be per-
formed by anyone wishing to 
obtain the contract. He pin-
pointed Berkeley as having an 
ideal set up with vehicles hav-
ing "to run the gauntlet" of 
all the recycling options before 
they can unload unuseable 
waste. To further implement 
this set up the public is 
educated by dump personnel 
on how to load their vehicle--
stratification of load--so that 
layers can be peeled off as 
dumpers run this gauntlet. A 
computerized scale weighs the 
recyclable waste as dumpers 
pass through, adding the 
various amounts together and 
issuing a refund check within 

minutes as dumpers depart. 
Rust informed his audience 

that groundbreaking took 
place for a compost pile at the 
Glenwood dump site on April 
16. Initially it will consist of 
preselected, pre shredded 
organic material with no ma-
jor purchase of equiptment 
taking place until "we see how 
it goes." 

Calling Lane County's at-
tempts at converting waste in-
to fuel in the late 1970's as 
"our own version of WP-
PSS, '' Rust pointed out that 
it's unavoidable when burning 
garbage to produce poison 
gases such as dioxins. On a 
more positive note, Rust said 
he believes Lane County's 17 
recycling centers, which are 
part of the 18 site dump net-
work, can't be matched in 
numbers by any other Oregon 
county. 

Future power outlook is somewhat less than welcome 
by Ellen Platt 
TORCH Associate Editor 

Lane County Commissioner 
Peter Defazio discussed ''the 
Energy Future in the Nor-
thwest", Monday April 16, 
saying that we are "at a signifi-
cant crossroads in the Nor-
thwest with the WPPSS 
debacle still happening.'' 

Defazio predicted that 
"We'll have a surplus (of 
energy) until 1990, and then 
we'll have a crisis, and build 
more WPPSS plants." He 
cited pressure on the Bon-
neville Power Administration 
(BP A) and the Public Utilities 
Commission (PUC) by the 
thermal and power industries 
"to back away from conserva-
tion'' as the primary obstacles 
to continued energy conserva-
tion measures. 

Ref erring to the BP A as 
''the largest, most powerful, 
least accountable unit of 
government in Oregon, and 
probably the US,'' Defazio 
pointed to inaccurate energy 
consumption predictions by 
the BP A as the background to 
the current Washington Public 
Power Supply System 
(WPPSS) problems. 

The BPA's hydro-thermal 
program planners predicted 
"20 nuclear plants in the Nor-
th west by 1990," and 
"electricity too cheap to 
meter.'' Several assumptions 
account for ''how such a 
mistake was made'' says 
Defazio. 

First, the BP A assumed 
people would increase their 
power use at a steady rate in-
definitely, regardless of rate 
increases. 

Second, it was taken for 
granted that the Northwest 
had to be "energy self-
sufficient'' and that the power 
lines connecting the Northwest 
to other parts of the West were 
"considered one-way." This 

fails to take into account 
seasonal variations in power 
use in the West -- California 
and the Southwest use more 
power in the summer for air 
conditioning, while the Nor-
thwest uses more energy in the 
winter for heating. 

Third, the BP A system is 
geared for an ''energy 
emergency'' -- '' all power 
planning revolves around 
meeting that demand'' on the 
coldest day of the driest year 
(a four-year drought in the late 
1920s is the basis for determin-
ing the "critical low water" 
level in the Columbia). 

Defazio describes it as 
"absurd to build and pay for 
this energy emergency,'' 
without considering the 
possiblilities of consumer con-
servation or industry shut-
down in the event of an energy 
shortage. He adds that there is 
a power generation potential 
of 4,000 megawatts (or 4 
nuclear power plants worth) in 
the BP A system. 

When the Pacific Northwest 
Power Act was written ''some 
conservation provisions were 
added after a long fight" by 
Congressman Jim Weaver and 
other legislators. These give 
preference to "cost effective" 
conservation, the development 
of renewable resources, before 
building thermal generating 
plants, Defazio stated. 

Despite these directives, the 
BP A has written "new con-
tracts to WPPSS reobligating 
themselves for the debt", 
assuming an "$8 billion debt 
with no public process involv-
ed'' asserts Defazio. In addi-
tion, the BPA budgeted "$177 
million for conservation 
measures, and $800 million for 
WPPSS" interest payments 
this year. 

Other actions by the BP A 
and the PUC indicate they are 
''not thinking of how long it 
takes to get an energy conser-

vation program going" states 
Defazio. Besides the budgeting 
priorities of the BP A, Public 
Utilities Commissioner Gene 
Maudlin has published a study 
''questioning the wisdom of 
conservation in a time of 
energy surplus," and has sug-
gested reinstalling 
''progressive rate schedules,'' 
which give rate breaks to con-
sumers and industries which 
use more electricity. 

Defazio says "all these 
pushes are to prevent a crisis in 
ten years, "by spending $2 
billion on WPPSS not conser-
vation.'' Currently electricity 
costs 4 cents per kilowatt 
hour, when WPPSS actually 
produces power, it will be at 4 
times this cost, or 10-12 cents 
per kilowatt hour. 
''Conservation will be the 
loser unless we get organized 
to prevent plants we don't 
need" asserts Defazio. 

Alternatives to WPPSS 

Although Defazio admits 
that "right now I'm not real 
optimistic,'' he suggested 
several energy conservation 
measures which could create a 
"self-supporting system." 

Among these were increas-
ing conservation now so that 
the energy surplus could be 
projected. "If we can project 
surpluses 15-20 years into the 
future, we can sell 'firm 
power' (guaranteed amounts) 
to other states at three times 
the rate they pay now.'' 

Observing that conservation 
provides local and state jobs 
through weatherization pro-
grams and long-term power 
sales, Defazio suggests the 
funds could be used for fur-
ther conservation measures 
creating more surpluses ''thus 
it would become a self-
supporting system.'' 

Defazio says while ''the 
Pacific Energy Council is 

Defazio discusses energy future. 

pushing the BP A to conserva-
tion,'' another measure to en-
courage conservation would 
be a different selection process 
for the Public Utilities Com-
missioner. 

At this time the governor 
appoints someone to the posi-
tion. Defazio envisions so-
meone who is "elected or ad-
vised by a citizen council.'' 

"The PUC should represent 
the consumer interests before 
the BP A; but he (Maudlin) 
doesn't choose to do that." 

While current conservation 
goals are being met, "the Nor-

~ thwest Power Council has no s control over the BP A. If the 
..... BPA says don't conserve, they f can only use moral suasion to 
n effect the BPA." 
! Defazio concludes that the 

"slow approach to conserva-
tion in the last few years" on 
the part of utilities that buy 
from the BP A is because they 
"can't approach conservation 
too quickly or their rates 
rise.'' 

Earth Fair '84 continues 
Speakers 

Thursday, April 19 
10 - 11 a.m. 
Steve Solomon, Owner of Territorial Seed Company: Garden-
ing Year Around 
11 a.m. - Noon• 
Jim Weaver, Congressman: National Agriculture & Forestry 
Policy 
Noon - 1 p.m 
Gretta Goldenman, Institute for Food & Development Policy: 
Exploding the Hunger Myth 
1 - 2 p.m. 
Wendell Wood, Oregon Natural Resources Council: Oregon 
Wild Lands - A Discussion of the Oregon Wilderness Bill 
Friday, April 20 
Child carseat safety presentation in the main cafeteria open 
area, 9 a.m. - I p.m. 
10 - 11 a.m. 1 

John Ripplinger, LCOG; Stephan Viggiano, LTD; Jarva Shu, 
Paratransit; Marty Douglass, LRAP A: Panel Presentation of 
T-2000 Plan 
11 a.m. - Noon 
Marion Toepke, Home Birth Practice in Eugene Area: Natural 
Birth & Appropriate Technology 
11 a.m. and Noon 
The Society for Creative Anachronism Medieval Entertain-
ment ' 
2 - 3 p.m. 
The Shumba Band, Zimbabwe Music 
All speakers will give their presentations in the Board Room. 
On Tuesday April 17, presentations will be given in PE Con-
ference Room 205. Other exceptions are noted as follows: 
1 Forum Building Room 308; 2 Performing Arts Theater; 3 
Study Skills Lab Room 483 
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Upcoming raffle sponsored by Campus Ministry 
1st prize is a $1200 pendant 

by Joan Hite 
for the TORCH 

A Black Hill's gold and 
amethyst pendant worth over 
$1200 is just one of the prizes a 
lucky ticket-holder could win 
in Campus Ministry's upcom-
ing raffle. 

The Campus Ministry staff 
is selling tickets now for the 
drawing which will take place 
May 10. Single ticket price is 

Poor----- continued from page 2 

the state would reduce his 
food starnp allotment. 

Like most very low-income 
people, Tom lives on a 
vegetarian diet. He grows his 
own sprouts in a gallon jar in 
his kitchen. Mixed with rice or 
millet, it makes his dinner. For 

$1 and eleven tickets can be 
purchased for $10. Proceeds 
from the raffle will go toward 
the general support of Campus 
Ministry. 

Staff members hope the raf-
fle brings in anywhere from 
$3,000 to $5,000 to help cover 
the costs of the services which 
the organization provides--
such as food baskets, special : 

lunch, he makes himself a tofu 
salad, carrying it to school in a 
plastic yoghurt container. 
When space allows, he grows 
his own vegetables in a garden. 
But there's no garden at 
Tom's current apartment. 

Tom stretches his food 
stamps to make them last all 

workshops, or guest speakers 
and--also to meet general of-
fice expenses. 

Aside from the amethyst 
pendant other prizes to be raf-
fled include a used, but totally 
reworked outboard motor; 
and recordings from the Polka 
Pipers, a local musical group. 
Fr. James Dieringer, the direc-
tor of Campus Ministry, is 

month. He is one of the many 
LCC students who waits in 
line each month for the free 
allotment of cheese and butter 
the government provides the 
needy. Cheese is more expen-
sive than some meats, and 
Tom is appreciative of the 
hand-out. 

hoping to solicit a few more 
prizes during the coming 
weeks. 

The idea for the raffle 
blossomed when Dieringer's 
artist brother-in-law made the 
jewelry and gave it to the 
priest with the hope that Cam-
pus Ministry could use it to 
raise money. A local woman, 
Anne Reilly, is coordinating 

everytime I get really sick. I 
can get a free check-up, but 
the prescriptions are what cost 
money.· I never know if I'll be 
able to ride it out without 
spending the money for the 
medicine or not.'' 

0 
sdf SERVE woRd pROCEssiNq 

0 

0 0 

He has a car he bought for 
$100, but says "it's always on 
the brink of breaking down. 
The steering is so bad no one 
else could drive it.'' Tom is 
never sure, each morning 
when he leaves for school, 
whether the car will make it 
there or not. 

Poverty has been a part of 
Tom's life for so long now 
he's almost used to it. "I think 
there's been about three years 
In my life that I made over 
$5,000 a year," he says. 
"That's when I used to work 
as an orderly in a hospital 
back East. I haven't even 
bothered filing an income tax 
return for years now. I don't 
make enough money for it to 
even matter.'' 

0 

0 

• IBM personal computers t.1nd _fe1.1tunng ... 0 • Epson RX-80 p1inters 
Perfect Writer,"'Sottware • Diablo 630 printer 0 

,, ~inko•s copies I 
When Tom gets sick, he 

uses the Student Health Ser- · 
vices at LCC, but says, "I go 
through major decisions 

No job, no job skills, no 
future to look forward to. . ------· 344-7894 

40%OFF! 
That's what LCC Theatre is offering LCC students (with current ID) for as 
many as four tickets to "My Sister Eileen," the 1940 comedy opening next 
Friday, the 27th! 

This means you will pay just $3 for a reserved seat ticket, for which the 
regular price is $5. We make this special offer to LCC students because we 
want to introduce you to this wonderful resource you have right here on cam-
pus. Once you've seen an LCC Theatre production, we believe, you'll come 
back for more! 

So get over to the box office, right in the vestibule of the theatre, and order 
your bargain tickets! (Your order will be held three days, if you wish, for 
payment.) Box office hours are 10 to 4. 

Then join us on one of these performance dates for an evening of fun at your 
own LCC Theatre! 

April 27, 28, May 2, 3, 4, 5 at 8:00 p.m. 

the raffle for Campus 
Ministry. 

Although they've never 
sponsored a raffle before, the 
people at Campus Ministry 
have high hopes for this one 
and see a place for raffles in 
future fundraising efforts. 
Says Dieringer, "If it's 
halfway successful, we'll see if 
we can't keep it going." 

Like many other LCC students 
on campus today, back in 
school because life had no 
meaning. His decision to enter 
school was a "last chance ef-
fort" on his part to somehow 
pull his life together. 

Although a student's life is a 
struggle, Tom's last chance ef-
fort is slowly paying off. He's 
completed half of his training 
at LCC, and is determined to 
finish the program. 

"I want a job where I can 
feel I'm being of some kind of 
service to people," Tom says. 
''That very well may take me 
out of Eugene and into 
another city," he says. "But I 
want my work to reflect my 
value system and have some 
direction to it.'' 



Stigmatization discourages 
the seeking of tutorial help 
by Marisela Rizik 
TORCH Staff Writer 

"Students of color do not flunk, they get discourag-
ed.'' And that is when they start having academic pro-
blems says Jan Oliver, who spoke at a meeting spon-
sored by the Multicultural Center April 11. 

Oliver, assistant director of the Council for Minority 
Education (CME) at the University of Oregon, discuss-
ed some of the services offered by the CME through the 
UO as well as the problems encountered by transfer 
students in general. 

Oliver blames "stigmatization" and the fear of being 
considered dumb as reasons which keep minority 
students from seeking tutorial help and making use of 
the available counseling. As a result, they fail to com-
municate their difficulties and become discouraged. 

Oliver says transfer students are having similar pro-
blems and are reluctant to attend the proper orientation-
-assuming they already know what is going to be 
presented or that they don't need to know it. This 
"dangerous assumption" can lead to serious academic 
difficulties and with it discouragement, she says. 

To help minority students cope with large lecture 
classes, CME sponsors composition (WR 121, 122, 123) 
and mathematics courses. These courses are not 
remedial or easier, simply more personal. The courses 
are limited to 15 students with priority given to minority 
students. To facilitate individual attention, the instruc-
tors are paid more to do their own grading Oliver says. 

"See yourself as a consumer, ask for what you're 
paying for -- ask questions,'' Oliver advises students. 

The CME office is located on the third floor of 
Oregon Hall, the Administration Building, University 
of Oregon. Regular hours are 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. To avoid 
a last minute rush, an appointment is advisable though 
it is not required. 

Black college opportunities next topic 
The Multicultural Center is sponsoring an informa-

tion session for students interested in learning about 
educational programs and opportunities at black col-
leges. 

According to an article that appeared in the Jan. 16, 
1984 edition of the Oregonian, officials of black col-
leges say that a black student is more likely to complete 
studies successfully at a black school than at a white 
school. Black schools historically have done a better job 
of motivating and stimulating their students says Her-
man Branson, president of Lincoln University in Penn-
sylvania. 

Ms. Pearl S. Gray, affirmative action officer at 
Oregon State University (OSU) and Co-chairperson of 
Portland's Black Colleges Committee, will be at Lane 
Community College on April 23, 1984 between noon 
and 1 p.m., in the Center Bldg., Room 219, to offer in-
sights and suggestions. 

For more information, please contact Kent Gorham 
at the Multicultural Center, Center 209, or extension 
2276. 
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2nd PRIZE *1st PRIZE 
25HP GOLD 

20 
THIRD 
PRIZES RECONDITIONED 

OUTBOARD 
MOTOR 

DRAWING MAY 10, 
TICKETS $1 EACH 

OR 
BOOK OF 11 FOR $10 
(TAX DEDUCTIBLE) 

DESIGNER 
AMETHYST 
PENDANT 

1984 YOU NEED NOT BE 
PRESENT TO WIN 

TICKETS AVAILABLE 
CAMPUS MINISTRY 
125 CENTER BLDG. 

ALL PROCEEDS GO TO LCC CAMPUS MINISTRY 

BIBLE STUDY: RAY WAETSEN 241 Ml A 
THURSDAY 2 - 3 
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·'Sister Eileen' star sets sights high 
by Chris Gann 
TORCH Editor 

She's a young professional actress who'll 
soon be heading for a bigger career in Los 
Angeles. And this month she's playing the part 
of a young aspiring actress looking to ''make 
it" in the Big Apple. 

But that's about all Serena Scholls and Eileen 
McKenny, the character she plays in ''My Sister 
Eileen,'' have in common. The comedy opens 
on LCC' s Performing Arts Theatre stage April 
27. 

Serena, who earnd a BA in performing arts 
from the University of Southern California in 

- 1982, began acting here in Eugene when she was 
10 years old. The only "acting job" poor Eileen 
can get, however, is passing out samples of 
chewing gum. 

Serena attended LCC for four terms in 
1978-79. As a perfoming arts major she played 
in "The Mad Woman of Chaillot." She 
transfered to USC in 1979. 

She moved back to Eugene about a year ago. 
Since then she says she's been working in TV 
and radio commercials and played the role of 
Fleur Stein in "Miss Reardon Drinks a Little" 
at the University of Oregon this past winter. 
This term Serena is also taking an acting class 
from Ed Ragozzino -- something she says she 
didn't have the opportunity to do when she first 
attended LCC. 

"My Sister Eileen" is a comedy set in 1940. 
Author Ruth McKenney based the stories on 
the experiences, with embellishments, she and 
her sister Eileen had as young adults. 

The play is filled with goofy characters and 
slap-stick humor -- stock forumlas of family 
humor and old movies. 

In "Eileen" the McKenney sisters move from 
Columbus, Ohio to a Greenwich Village base-
ment apartment in New York City. Eileen, 
whom Serena describes as a ''naive, dumb, 
ding-bat,'' wants to be an actress. The more 

The LCC Theater is of-
fering a 40 percent discount 
on ticket prices to students 
for all shows of ''My Sister 
Eileen." Theater Opera-
tions Manager Dick Reid 
says he hopes the . reduced 
prices will encourage 
students to attend the show. 
Students with current photo 
ID may purchase up to four 
reserved seat tickets, nor-
mally selling for $5, for $3 
each. Box office hours are 
10 a.m. to 4 p.m. 

Serena Scholls portrays a naive ding-bat in 
"My Sister Eileen." 

level-headed Ruth aspires to a writing career. 
Stan Elberson directs "Eileen" and Bruce 

Bibby creates the sets. 
Pat Matteri, a local actress and teacher at 

Roosevelt Middle School, plays Ruth. The part • 
of Mr. Appopolous, the sisters' eccentric Greek · 
landlord, is played by Pat Michalek. Other ac-
tors in the production are Lyn Burg, Anthony 
Reid, Renn Pupke, Sandra Williams, Katherine 
Karhoff, Steve Schmunk, Pat Brand, Daniel 
Ryan, Kae Friesen, John Wilson, Kyle Pace, 
and Owen Wright. 

After the opening, "My Sister Eileen" will 
also be performed on April 28, and May 2-5. 
Curtain time is 8 p.m. 

Second Nature 
Used Bikes 

buy-sell-trade 
Specializing in 
recycled bikes. 
used wheel~ 
&parts ~ 

1712 Willamette 
343-5362 

Thursday thru Saturday 6:30 • :12:00 
I/2 price on Thursday reg. $3.00 

3875 Main St. Springfield ~o\ 
~\CO 

~o 747•I976 
PIZZA - POPCORN - CANDY 
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Green & Newby: .At the movies-'Moscow on the Hudson' 
by Mike Newby 
and Mike Green 
TORCH Staff Writers 

Life in Moscow can be a 
total bummer at times. Im-
agine a saxaphonist with the 
Moscow Circus who waits in 
line for shoes that don't fit, or 
for a roll of toilet paper. Such 
is life for Vladimir Ivanoff, 
portrayed by Robin Williams 
in "Moscow on the Hudson," 
a movie about the freedom we 
Americans take for granted. 

Green: It's a delightful 
movie, because it portrays the 
defection of a Russian citizen 
in a light-hearted vein. I found 
myself cheering for Vladmir as 
he faced readjustment to a 
totally foreign culture. It was 
easy to get caught up in the 
film. It's a very good film and 

a big part of what makes it so 
good is the acting of Robin 
Williams. 

Newby: I'll have to agree, 
but not whole-heartedly. 
Robin Williams is one of my 
favorite personalities ("Mork 
and Mindy," "Garp," 
"Popeye") -- he always makes 
me laugh. In "Moscow" I 
laughed as he went from one 
calamity to the next, but I ex-
pected more situation-
comedy, and less filler sex-
scenes. 

Green: Yes, I expected a lit-
tle more comedy also. But I 
think "Mork" type comedy 
would have taken away from 
the story. 

Newby: This movie accen-
tuated drama and comedy in a 
pleasant way. First, Vladimir 
is in Russia struggling to sur-
vive: Standing in bread or 
toilet paper lines have become 
second-nature. Humor is only 
found in his grandfather, a 
Russian comic, who makes a 
point of flipping off govern-
ment officials and shouting 
obscenities about the Kremlin 
from his window. 

Then Vladimir makes a trip 

to America with the circus and 
defects in Bloomingdale' s 
Department Store. His life is 
chaotic at first with his new 
black family, Cuban lawyer, 
Italian girlfriend and Jewish 

boss. It was interesting to 
watch how he adjusts to our 
multicultural society. 

Green: The underlying 
theme of all the cultural mixes 
is patriotism. The movie at-

tempts to show us just how 
valuable our freedoms are. 
The message is obvious --
we're lucky to live in the home 
of the free .... And also to have 
plenty of toilet paper. 

Latarski's album climbs charts 
by Kevin Harrington 
TORCH Staff Writer 

Unbeknownst to most of his 
students, LCC guitar instruc-
tor Don Latarski has a critical-
ly acclaimed album on the 
charts. Lifeline, the thirty 
year old U of O graduate's se-
cond album, has hit number 
16 on the national jazz 
playlists. According to Latar-
ski, the making of the album 
was neither quick nor inexpen-
sive. "P.A. U.S.A.' records 
agreed to release, promote and 
package it, if I would furnish 
them with a finished master, 
which I paid for through a 
consortium · of backers. We 
recorded it at Triad Studios 
here in Eugene for $15,000. 

Studio time and musicians 
were the two biggest costs. We 

used 150 hours of studio time 
at about $50 per hour.'' 

Despite the albums modest 
commerical success, Latarski 
is "not exactly rich" and will 
continue to teach guitar at 
LCC and the U of 0. "I just 
want to keep putting albums 
out because if you want to be a 
viable artist and be taken 
seriously you have to have 
product." 

Latarski may have little pro-
blem finding a label in the 
future. "I'm seriously con-
sidering starting my own label 
with a few other people, so we 
can have more control over the 
product and how it's marketed 
and promoted. I know that 
I'm very young at this yet, but 
having made a couple of 
albums, I've learned of some 
important things that I would 

like to see changed.'' 

Lifeline, which also 
features Dan Siegal, can best 
be described as accessible jazz. 
One does not have to be ''into 
jazz'' to enjoy this instrumen-
tal album of original compsi-
tions. 

The tunes on Lifeline 
provide a wide variety of tem-
pos and styles - from the 
funky-bassed, soul influenced 
title track, to the pretty, 
classical sounding "Night Rid-
dle." The up-tempo "Lost to 
Love" was my favorite 
though, with its good sax and 
dancing guitar riffs. 

Persons wishing to augment 
Don Latarski's income can 
purchase Lifeline at Earth 
River and Cat's Meow 
Records in Eugene, among 
other outlets. 

LCC wins 15th annual Mt. Hood track and field relays 

Friday & Saturday 
April 20 & 21 

"VALLEY BOYS" 

683-4686 
1475 Franklin Blvd. 

by Dennis Monen 
TORCH Sports Editor 

Lane set the pace at the 15th 
annual Mt. Hood track and 
field relays and walked away 
with trophies for both men 
and women against Mt. Hood, 
Bellevue and Spokane Com-
munity Colleges Saturday, 

·SAL E· 
15 % off on (Alvin & Forester) 

Drafting Tables· and 
Drawing Boards 

50% off on Staedtler Mars 
7 Pen Sets 

15 °/o off on Rembrandt Pastels 
Sets or single stock 

50% off on Gold and Silver 
Frames 

25% off on Black 
F1 

Oregon Att' Supply 
720 E. 13th 683-2787 

April 14 in Gresham. 

The LCC men have cap-
tured their second straight vic-
tory at the annual event, scor-
ing 107 points to overcome se-
cond place Spokane's 83 
points. The LCC women 
outscored Spokane al~o, with 
a 7 point spread, 99-92. 

Spokane was running in se-
cond place in the women's 
division as well. 

Mark Cumer, of Lane led 
the Titans with a 140.6 foot 
first place win in the hammer 
throw, a third place heave of 
140.6 foot with the discus and 
a 46. 7 foot hurl in the shot 

team championships. She said 
she thought it would be a close 
meet, but that the field events 
pulled the Titans through. 

------------• put. 

Michelle led the women in 
the events and captured a 
school record in the shot put, 
sending it a distance of 42.8 
feet and placed second in the 
discus, heaving it 150.9 feet. 

-Your 
CHOICES 

make the 
difference. 

BIRTH CONTROL 
PREGNANCY TESTS 

PAP SMEARS 

BIRTH 
CONTROL PILLS $6-7 .50 
DIAPHRAGM JELLY $4.00 
CONDOMS 3for$.75 
SPONGE S 1.00 

PRIVATE • PROFESSIONAL 
CONVENIENT 

In the women's division, 
Coach Lyndell Wilken says 
she is thrilled because it's the 
first time they've ever won this 
particular event in Gresham 
and it sets the stages for the 

The next scheduled (M/W) 
track and field meet will take 
place in Albany at 1 :OOp.m. 
with Blue Mountain Com-
m unity College, Saturday 
April 21. 

I, 2, & 3 Bedroom Apartments 
Available Now! 

1 Bedroom ... $155.50 
2 Bedroom ... $182.50 
3 Bedroom ... $200.50 

Resuvations for the remammg apart-
~ ments are now being processed through 

the mana1ers of Jiu at ... 

475 Lindal~ 
Springfield, Oregon 

747-5411 



--For Sale--
BUS PASS for sale now! Good up 
through June, $20. Call 746-1614, 
evenings are best. 
BIKER'S LADIES special. Women's 
leather motorcycle jacket, size 10, 
$135. Bell fulljace-6 718, $40. Call 
747-9460. 
CUSTOM BUILT hitch for Subaru, 
$65 or best offer. 683-5508, ask for 
Jim, leave message. 
MOBILE HOME 1970, 12x64 expan-
do. Two-acre lot rents for 
$JOO/month. Storage galore, pets ok, 
room for horse barn too. Make offer, 
weekends only. 747-6369 or 689-5766. 
TWIN BED with mattress & boxspr-
ing and matching six drawer chest, 
good shape. Call 726-6072 evenings. 
AKC SPRINGERS, quality breeding 
& care. Must go! From $100. 
998-6890, eves. 688-0930, message. 
'70 BROADMORE MOBILE HOME, 
12x64, 2 bedroom, 2 baths, 7xl 3 ex-
pando. $5000/offer. 747-6369, days; 
689-5766, evenings. 
SUZUKI 4 into 1 R. C. Header, $100. 
Call Paul, 689-9487 or 343-3359. 
REGGAE MUSIC -- complete catalog 
of records. $7.50 albums, $2 singles. 
Contact Frank, 4733 Franklin Blvd. 
BEA UT/FUL SUZUKI GUITAR; 
paid $380, must sell, will sacrifice for 
$145. 342-1717. 
DESK AND STEREO for sale. Call 
746-6191. 
CABOVER CAMPER, 8 foot, very 
clean, $900. 942-8491. 
CORONET B; $100, excellent condi-
tion. 942-8491. 
AUTO STEREOS, GUNS, washer-
dryer, roto-tiller and more. Looking? 
Call Merrill 2-5 p.m., 741-0220. 
ULTRA-SENSITIVE professional 
stethoscope for the price of a cheapie. 
Only $20 for Littmann quality. 
689-0795, anytime. 
LAWN MOWER-electric, $85; hang-
ing lamp, $10; workbench, $65; dining 
table & 4 chairs, $155; desk, $35. 
686-0987. 

STEREO SYSTEM; Marantz 40 watts 
per channel duel turntable, 3-way 
speakers, one year old. $395 Call 
933-2151. 
CLASSIC RALEIGH 25" men's bike, 
racing frame wlall new parts this year. 
Sell for $175. Call 933-2151. 
WOODSTOVE, LARGE BOOK 
CASE, tables, plants, couch, chair, 
pictures. 'Best offer over $125. 
484-2531. 
WASHER & DRYER, $225; 20.8' 
GE defrost regrigerator, $325; couch, 
$135; hide-a-bed, $95. 686-0987 
"MOTORCYCLE 
HELMETS'' ... salesman 
samples ... below wholesale prices. 
Full-open-motorcross. Call Dave after 
6 p.m. 461-2359. 
QUALITY CUSTOM-MADE shoes, 
low prices. Make appointment for fit-
ting, see catalog. Victoria, 688-4501 
before 10 p.m. 

KAST/NGER HIKING BOOTS, new 
8-9 112, $95; complete aquarium, $25; 
car power amp $20. Lonn, 726-8083. 
'73 HONDA CB350; windshiel, 
rollbar, rack. Looks good, runs good. 
$450 or best. 688-5259, evenings. 
PEUGEOT 12 speed, PFNJO, 22 inch, 
touring bike, $240. Alto sax,$100. 
Call 342-2890. 
UNSCRAMBLED TV 1 know how it 
works on Jerrold DIC units. Watch 
movies free. Call 747-4175. 
'79 YAMAHA 650, vetter fairing and 
bags. New tires and battery, $1375 or 
offer. 747-1148. 
PENTAX CAMERA with regular 
55mm 1.8 lens and 90-230mm zoom 
lens, $200. Call Tom at 342-7583, 
afternoons. 
MEN'S 10 SPEED Bianchi bike; ex-
cellent condition, 23" frame; alloy 
rims and crank, $175. 683-0808. 

3 HP FUEL DRIVEN riding vacuum 
cleaner with optional nobby treaded 
tires, jack and jumper cables not in-
cluded. Dexter Minton, 687-8339. 

WOMEN'S JO SPEED Peugeot bike; 
great condition, 11" frame, headlight 
and folding saddle baskets, $150. 
683-0808. 

ONKYO-NEW-Al2Amp. 35wlchll-
8ohms, 50wlchl-4ohms, 15-30KHZ, 
$123, life time service warranty, 
distributor. 345-5662 after 5 p.m., all 
day weekends. 
ZENITH HOME cassette player, $20; 
Koss electrostatic headphones, $18; 
Airline 30 watt receiver, $20. 
342-7336. 
SONY-NEW-TAAX 35-30w/chl, 
built-in 5 band EQ-$118. Life time ser-
vice warranty. Distributor, 345-5662, 
after 5 p.m., all day weekends. 
AIWA-NEW-ADF12OU-cassette-
Dolby B and C. $124. Distributor, 
345-5662 after 5 p.m., all day 
weekends, life time service warranty. 
DBX-200, $99, ONKYO-TX35 digital 
receiver-45w/chl, $256, life time ser-
vice, Crazy Stan's Atomic Systems, 
345-5662 after 4 p.m. All day 
weekends. 
WOODSTOVE-old · brown enamel, 
good shape, $50. 746-1686 before 12 
a.m., ask for George. 

-ForRent-
FEMALE TO SHARE 2 bedroom 
house $125 month plus utilities. 25th 
& Main, Springfield. Merrill, 2-5 
p.m., 741-0220. 
BEAUTIFUL LARGE DUPLEX in 
rhe South Eugene Hills. Private room, 
rhare with two other persons. Call J.J. 
at 683-5010. 
SHARE LARGE HOUSE with 2 
others. Furnished, carpeted, quiet; 
piano, organ, VCR, patio. 687-1903. 
ROOM OPEN for woman in 
cooperative household 1 blocks south 
of U of 0. Harris Bus, $100 per 
month. 344-8737. 

-Services --
CHILD CARE -- early childhood ma-
jor -- $2 hr. or negotiable. Responsible 
14 year old with bachelor degree in 
social work, David 683-5213. 
PASCAL PROBLEMS? I can help, 
$5/hr. Call Margaret, 688-7720. 
FREE FULL MOUTH X-RAY at 
LCC Dental Clinic. Limited offer. 
Call Carolyn after 7 p.m. 344-8519. 

ASTROLOGY & TAROT readings. 
Find your place in the stars. Ann 
484-3163. 
EXPERIENCED WALLPAPER 
hanger. Very reasonable rates. Call 
Vona, 689-1387. 
COMPUTER SOIL TEST: Test 
'?arden soil, etc. Send sample and $10 
to: Cottage Computer Business, P. 0. 
Box 3258, Eugene, OR 97403. 
EXPERT AUTO REPAIR -- all 
makes. Reasonable prices, too. Call 
J.D. after 5 p.m. at 345-6444. 
ASTROLOGY CIRCLE meets Mon-
days 1-2 p.m., at the Eugene Public 
Library. All interested in astrology are 
welcome. 
MATURE WOMAN seeks work as 
house-sitter while you are away. 
Dependable, references. 484-4444. 
BRANDIE'S ALTERNATIVE 
Mailbox Service: Personalized private 
mail service, good rates, convenient 
services. 461-2528, 907 River Road. 
OREGON SAILING CLUB; 
cooperative sailing, community 
lessons. For class or membership info 
call 345-2214. 

-Automotive-
1976 YAMAHA 650, $750. 747-1279 
after 5 p.m. 

'74 AUDI FOX -- sound car, $900/ of-
fer. 747-6369, days; 689-5766, even-
ings. 
PARTING OUT '69 Bug, many parts. 
Call Phil after noon at 683-7183. 
1977 550 HONDA FOUR 
CYLINDER, full dress. Very well 
maintained. Vetter, Honda Line, and 
Bates equipped, $800. Message 
935-7856, Mark, after 6 p.m. 

1977 DATSUN 200SX, 78,000 miles. 
Great, dependable car. Maintenance 
records available. $2195/neg. 
345-2211. 

STRONG FORD 360 engine, com-
plete with bell housing & flywheel, 
$150. Call Paul, 343-3359 or 689-9487. 

'74 SUPER BEETLE, $1400 or best 
offer. Call 895-4038 after 6 p.m. 
1970-1974 BARRACUDA hood with 
fiberglass six-pack scoop. All straight. 
$100 or offer. 343-1861. 
SMALL BLACK MOPAR 727 Tor-
queflite; 3500 stall, manual body, 
ceramic clutches, all new. 343-1861. 

BEAUTIFUL 1977 BUICK REGAL-
new paint/top. loaded, 65,000 miles, 
only $3695(neg.) 683-1149, eves. 
'63 FORD FAlRLANE; 260 engine, 
V-8, needs work, $200 or best of/ er. 
Leave message 726-8655, Darrell. 

1974 MERCURY COMET; runs well, 
rough interior, $500. 935-4538. 
1970 PLYMOUTH FURY, good con-
dition, $300. See at 2945 Hilyard. 
PARTING OUT '69 Bug-doors, gas 
tank and much more. Call Phil after 
noon, 683-7183. 
1971 Datsun pickup, $915 or best of-
f er. Runs well, maintained. 
683-90291747-7585, keep trying. 
1968 VIP PLYMOUTH 
(vandalized)-excellent 283 motor, J our 
good 15" radials and wheels, five 
hole. 689-3068 after 4 p.m. 

--Wanted--
SHARE RIDES from Junction City 
area, Monday-Thursday, have car. 
998-6890-evenings. 
BABYSITTER NEEDED Friday-
Tuesday nights, never later than 11 
p.m. Preferably driver. Call Debbie at 
485-2106. 
USED RESTAURANT equipment; 
counter-top mixer, co// ee machine, 
oven, sinks. Will buy or irale. • 
687-2903. 

-Help Wanted-
HOFFMAN PRODUCE is accepting 
applications for summer employment. 
Contact LCC Student Employment 
Service for details. 

--Events--
coMING UP FOR SPRING, 
1984--YOUR GRADUA TJON! 
Ceremonies will be held on June 8 at 
7:30 p.m. in the LCC gymnasium. 
Caps and gowns will be fitted at the 
Bookstore June 8 between the hours 
of noon and 4:30 p.m. Graduates 
should assemble in the auxiliary gym --
not later than 7 p.m. -- to line up for 
the processional. IT'S YOUR BIG 
NIGHT! (Be sure to go to Student 
Records, second floor Center, Room 
110A and fill out an application for 
degree form.) 

- Lost & Found-
FOUND DOG-found male col-
lielaustralian sheppard mix on April 
12 on the Eugene Mall. 
Black/brown/white. Call 689-5504 to 
claim. 

LOST LCC BOOKSTORE BAG con-
taining visi-cal manual and Energy 
Economics. Please return to SRC, 2nd 
floor Center Building. 

--Free--
MY CAT NEEDS A HOME. 3 years, 
shots, spayed, 112 siamese fem ale, 
very loving. 683-2946. 

-Messages--
DOUG-you have my number. Give me 
a call. I want to hear from you. S 

FAWN AND RHEA-you are as slip-
pery as a bucket of eels, and lots of 
fun too. We love you. 

MR. BURROWS, if the demand for a 
Mr. Bill Doll raised, how could the 
producers meet the supply of demand 
if there is only one of you? An ECO 
Admirer. 
"BEING SJNGLE ... can be twice the 
fun. Meet that special someone. Nor-
thcoast Connections. Confidential, 
personalized service for singles 
straight or gay, 18-80. Call Carol, 
689-7536 evenings or Saturday. DIS-
COUNTS FOR SENIORS AND 
WOMEN. Main office, 707-677-3059 
anytime. Box 413, Arcata, CA 
95521." 

Applications 
are now being accepted for 
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Editorships 
TORCH Editor 

Editor has complete control of editorial content of the 
newspaper and is expected to adhere to Media Commis-
sion guidelines and the Oregon Code of Ethics for J our-
nalism. She/He is appointed by the Media Commission 
?uring Spring Term and ~ill serve F~ll, Winter and ~pr-
mg Terms of the followmg academic year. The Editor 
should have journalistic ability, training and experience. 
He/ she should have previous service on a high school, 
college or professional newspaper staff in such activities 
as will give her/him an adequate understanding of the 
operations of a newspaper. The Editor must be an of-
ficially registered student and maintain a 2.00 GPA. 
The Editor will receive a monthly salary. 

Denali Editor 

The Editor of Denali will design the structure of the 
84-85 staff and the production schedule. The editor can 
expect to work at least 20 hours per week. The Editor 
will have control of the hiring and managing of staff 
and will have the final word on all matters according to 
Media Commission guidelines. She/he must have a con-
crete understanding of the technical skills of managing 
production. The Editor will be in charge of budgeting of 
funds and assessing staff progress. A background in 
literature and art is very much encouraged. Writing 121 
is required. Tbe Denali Editor will be payed $200 per 
term. 

Applications 

The deadline for applications is Monday May 7, 1984 at 
5 p.m. Obtain applications for TORCH Editor from 
Pete Peterson, Faculty Adviser, room 205C, Center 
Building. Completed applications should be returned to 
Mr. Peterson. Obtain applications for Denali Editor 
from Peggy Marston, Center Bldg. 479, or Chuck Ruff, 
Center Bldg. 447. Completed applications should be 
returned to either one of these advisers. 
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Omnium 
Communications & computers 

A career talk on innovations in communications and com-
puter technology, and careers in the information age, is 
scheduled at LCC Thursday, April 26, from 3-4 p.m. Spon-
sored by the LCC Career Information Center; the talk will 
feature David Brader, executive editor of Home Computer 
magazine. 

The talk will be in 219 Center on the LCC main campus. The 
public is welcome. For information, call the Career Informa-
tion Center at 747-4501, ext. 2297. 

Crisis-prevention conference 

A crisis-prevention conference, "Mole Hills Out of Moun-
tains," will be held Saturday, April 28, at the Erb Memorial 
Union Forum Room at the University of Oregon. 

Sponsored by the UO Crisis Center, the conference will teach 
participants techniques for dealing with commonly occurring 
difficult situations in their lives. Developed for U'liversity 
students, the conference is open to the public as well. 

The conference will run from 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. Registra-
tion will be from 8-9 a.m. on the day of the conference. The 
cost is $3 for students taking the course for credit and $5 for 
other participants. . 

For more information, call Vicki Handy or Laurel Singer, 
686-3227, or write the Counseling Center, University of 
Oregon, Eugene, OR 97403. 

Tapes.try exhibition 

The Oregon Tapestry Invitational exhibition continues 
through May 10 at LCC gallery. A public reception will be Fri-
day, April 27, 8-10 p.m. The featured gallery talk will be 
presented by Nancy Hoskins, Weaving Instructor at Lane 
Community College, who will speak on "Tapestry - Then and 
Now," on Wednesday, May 2 at I p.m. Gallery hours: 
Monday-Thursday 8 a.m.-10 p.m. Friday 8 a.m .-5 p.m. 

Apple Booth 

The Apple Booth, sp0nsored by LCC Student Health Ser-
vices, will be in the cafeteria on Tuesday, May I, from 10-2 
p.m. 

LCC student Darlene Mancuso will give a video presentation 
and answer questions about Lane Memorial Blood Bank. She 
will also be scheduling appointments for Thursday's Blood 
Mobile. 

County Commissioner debate 

The Associated Students of the University of Oregon ace 
sponsoring a debate featuring the County Commissioner 
Canidates for Position 3. The event will be held April 27, 2:30 
p.m., in the Forum Room of the EMU, U of 0. It is free and 
open to the public. 

.. G t h 
Pl«:ase submit entries to Omnium-Gatherum in !he format In which you wa_nt them to appear. Priority will be given to LCC-a e r U_ m· related events, llnd entries will be chosen OD a ftrst-come basis; TORCH editors reserve the right to edit for length. 

The dating game 

"Have you been wondering what's happening to dating to-
day? Carol Green, clinical social worker, will lead a discussion 
on this topic Wednesday, May 2, from noon to 1:30 p.m. in the 
Board Room of the Administration Bldg. on Lane Community 
College's main campus. For more information on this 
Women's Program Brown Bag talk call 747-4501, ext. 2353. 

Bake sale 

Sigma Zeta - Phi Theta Kappa will be holding a bake sale on 
Thursday, April 26, from 9 a.m. to 3 p.m. in the Center Bldg., 
2nd floor, near the east wall. 

Wastewater committee 

The Lane County Board of Commissioners is seeking ap-
plications from citizens interested in serving on the 
Metropolitan Wastewater Service District Budget Committee. 

There are currently two vacancies on this committee, and in-
terested citizens living in Eugene and Springfield are encourag-
ed to apply. 

Applications are available in the Board of Commissioners' 
Office located on the plaza level of the Public Service Building 
at 125 East 8th Avenue in Eugene. To request applications, 
please call 687-4103. For further information contact Bud 
Rainey, County Administration Office at 687-4488. 

Portland architecture exhibit to open 

Ponland members of the American Institute of Architects 
who entered the organization's 1983 awards program will ex-
hibit their projects April 14-30 at the U of O School of Ar-
chitecture and Allied Arts. 

Photographs and drawings of built and unbuilt projects will 
be displayed in the main lobby of Lawrence Hall. The Portland 
Performing Arts Center as well as commercial and residential 
structures are included. 

The exhibit will be shown seven days a week from 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m. and is free and open to the public. 

Gourmet dinner 

A gourmet dinner with live, classical music is planned May 3 
by students in Lane Community College's Food Service 
Management program. The traditional pre-theater dinner 
features a meal prepared and served by LCC students in a 
restaurant atmosphere on the main campus. 

Tickets for the dinner must be purchased by April 30. The 
cost is $IO per person, with wine an additional $2. The spring 
meal will include coulibilac of salmon with sorrel sauce, fresh 
asparagus, and a filbert meringue and buttercream torte. 

Dinner starts at 6 p.m. LCC's production of "My Sister 
Eileen" starts at 8. 

For reservations and information, call the college at 
747-4501, ext. 2697. 

Peace Corps recruiters to visit 

Peace Corps recruiters will be at the U of O and in the com-
munity April 30-May 2 to provide information and interview 
people who arc interested in the international volunteer service 
agency. 

Area recruiters from the Seattle Peace Corps office will staff 
informational tables at the Erb Memorial Union from 9 a.m. to 
3 p.m. April 30-May I; Fifth Street Public Market from 10 
a.m. to 6 p.m. April 30-May 2; and the Eugene Employment 
Office, 432 W. 11th Ave., from 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. May 2. 

Persons interested in interviewing should attend a group 
meeting in the EMU Forum Room at 3:30 p.m. April 30. Inter-
views will be held from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. May 1-2 at the UO 
Career Planning and Placement Office and at Far West Federal 
Bank from 10:30 a.m. to noon and 1-4 p.m. May I. 

Peace Corps applications are available at the UO Career 
Planning and Placement Office, Hendricks Hall, Room 244. 

All events are open to the public without charge. For more 
information, contact Marsha Swartz, Peace Corps coordinator 
on campus, 686-3235. 

Walk America 

In what has been called the largest walking event in history, 
people all across the country wil take part in the March of 
Dimes WalkAmerica. In Eugene/Springfield the annual 30 
kilometer walk against birth defects will take place on Satur-
day, April 28, 1984. 

An estimated 2,000 walkers from the Eugene/Springfield 
area will participate. Last year, 1.5 million walkers in 1,100 
communities raised $22 million to fight birth defects, this coun-
try's number one child health problem. 

Mother's Day ceramic sale 

On May 1-2 ceramic ware made by LCC students and staff 
will be on sale in the cafeteria from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. Potters 
will be striving to underprice each other. Proceeds go back to 
LCC ceramic shop to repair and replace equipment. For more 
information call the LCC Ceramic Shop ext. 2417. 

Spring poetry festival 
The annual spring poetry festival of the Oregon State Poetry 

Association will be held at Corvallis on Saturday, April 28, at 
II a.m. at the Corvallis Arts Center, 700 SW Madison .Street. 

Highlights of the day include guest speaker Roger Weaver of 
Oregon State University, who will speak on "Quality in Free 
Verse;" also workshops on "Impromptu Poetry" by Sister 
Helena Brand; "Journals as a Source Book for Poetry" by 
Glenna Davolt; "Editing and Publishing a Literary Magazine 
and Running a Small Press" by John Hawkes an,d Penelope 
Spiro from Fedora Magazine. Following the workshops, an 
open mike reading will be chaired by Penny Avila. Winners of 
contest awards will be announced. 

A noon luncheon is planned and all interested Oregon po.els 
are invited to attend. Contact Linda Smith, 752-3645 for reser-
vations. Luncheon fee is $4.25 and may be paid at the door. 

UO Spring Street Faire 

The Associated Students of the University of Oregon are 
sponsoring the annual Spring Street Faire in the EMU Cour-
tyard May 16, 17, and 18. A group meeting for all interested 
participants will be held April 29, 3 p.m., in the ASVO office, 
Suite 4, EMU. 

Handcrafters and food vendors are invited to participate. 
Craft entries will be juried. Entries must be in the ASUO office 
no later than 4 p.m., April 26. Contact Bill Snyder, ASUO, 
Suite 4, EMU, 686-3724 for entry forms, instructions, and 
more information. The event is open to the public. 

Blue collar astronauts 

A Boeing Company engineer will speak about "blue collar 
astronauts" and other aspects of the aviation maintenance 
field in a talk at LCC Friday, April 27. 

Keith H. Miller, senior engineer in the large space systems 
group at Boeing, is traveling from Seattle to meet with LCC's 
Aviation Maintenance Technology program advisory commit-
tee. 

Miller's talk, scheduled from 10 to 11 :30 a.m. with time for 
questions, will take place in Forum 309 on the main campus. 
The public is invited. 

For more information, call James Brooks in LCC's Aviation 
Maintenance Technology program at 747-4501, ext. 2379. 

Maude Kerns 
Margaret Coe will be offering a 4-week Oil Painting 

Workshop to be held Thursday and Friday afternoons beginn-
ing April 26 . The workshop is for experienced painters and ex-
poses students to a variety of color and compositional exercises 
designed to stimulate an expanded personal approach to work-
ing. 

Maude Kerns offers a drop-in children' s art workshop each 
Saturday from 'IO a .m. - noon for children ages 5-14. Each 
class exposes children to a different fine an subject with pro-
jects designed to introduce children to a variety of techniques 
and media . 

Cancer support group 

The Bright Wings Cancer Support Center of Eugene, 
specializing in Community Education Programs, Counseling, 
and Support Services for individuals and families facing life-
threatening illnesses will offer a workshop on May 11th and 
12th titled: "We Are All Dying: An Investigation into the Art 
of Living". 

The workshop is an informational and experiential investiga-
tion of the nature of grief, loss, small and large deaths, 
forgiveness, the joy in life, and the challenge of living in a 
moment-to-moment state of awareness, even in the face of 
death. 

The fee for the one and a half day workshop is $50. and pre-
registration is requested by April 27. Call the Bright Wings 
Center at 342-6053 for more information. The general public, 
health professionals, and those facing the situation of a life-
threatening illness are invited to register. 
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